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Abstract

Construction contracting firms (CCFs) are functioning in a highly volatile and competitive industrial environment making it imperative to bid for the
projects that can produce the most return and market share. The decision making process to bid or not is based on various factors that vary from
project to project and firm to firm. The aim of this work is to analyze the impact of firm size and experience on extrinsic factors influencing the
bid/no-bid decision for construction projects. The questionnaire was pilot tested and designed in three parts. The final questionnaire was sent to
300 CCFs registered with Pakistan Engineering Council (PEC) and respondents were asked to rate the factors on a Likert scale. Out of 300
questionnaires, 167 completed responses are returned representing a response rate of 56%. The collected data are then analyzed using Mann-
Whitney U test through Statistical Package for Social Sciences (SPSS). Findings show the various degrees of differences between small and large, and
young and mature CCFs with regard to factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision. Small firms need to overcome increasing market value and
number of competitors in the market. They need to develop relationship with government officials in order to secure their bids. Mature firms need
to review the payment practices of clients, politician pressure and business level of the client before entering into the bid. Availability of required
material and skilled labor are of prime importance for the mature firms’ success.

Keywords: Bid/no-bid decision, construction contracting firms, developing countries, firm experience, firm size.

Globally, the construction industry has continued to play a critical role in economies of both developed and
developing nations (Zhao et al., 2014). The developing countries’ construction contracting firms (CCFs) are on the rise
and are becoming important global players (Low et al., 2020). Developing countries’ CCFs are playing an important
role in the worldwide economy, and are nowadays open to different challenges as they need to operate in risky
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political conditions and markets (Korkmaz & Messner, 2008). Although these challenges carry new opportunities for
firms to access new clients in the country, but at the same time, firms also need to counter challenges like new project
environment, political conditions, local laws for procurement, new competitors and different quality demands of the
clients (Ren et al., 2012; Zawawi et al., 2016).

To survive in a competitive construction industry, it is extremely imperative for a firm to secure tenders and produce a
profit (Egemen & Mohamed, 2007). There are two ways for a construction firm to obtain the job i.e. they can
negotiate with the client or participate in competitive bidding to win the project (Magsoom et al., 2018; Shash, 1993).
Scholars argue that construction firms need to make a critical decision of participating in the bid or not, once an
invitation is received (EI-Mashaleh, 2013; Ma, 2011; Li et al., 2020). Wanous et al. (2003) found that winning the bid is
extremely challenging especially in today’s competitive construction markets. The most used technique in the
construction market to avail a bid is competitive bidding (Fu et al., 2002). Under the competitive bidding technique,
contractors face large number of problems. Hence, the decision of actually participating in the bid is one of the first
and most crucial steps that need to be taken (Ma, 2011), and involves a process of gathering information from
disparate different sources (Bageis & Fortune, 2009).

Pakistan as an emerging economy, is gradually becoming an important economic force in Asia because of its booming
service sector and thriving small and medium enterprises (SMEs) (Magsoom & Charoenngam, 2014; Ndubisi & Iftikhar,
2012). However, currently it is suffering from COVID 19, inflation and power crisis that adversely impact the
construction industry (Magsoom et al., 2020; Di Gregorio et al., 2008). Focusing on the country’s stability, World Bank
indicated a political stability index of as -2.49, and Heritage Foundation gave an economic stability index of 44(Hill,
2008). As construction and infrastructure development is a key source for enhancing the economy and controlling the
unemployment rate in any region, projects undertaken by construction firms are of extreme importance (Korkmaz &
Messner, 2008). The construction industry has faced problems in many large projects, for example, Allama Igbal
International Airport (AIIAP) and Tarbela Dam extension project had faced time and cost overruns mainly due to
incompetent firms won the projects (Ahmad et al., 2018; Razzaq et al., 2018; Shabbar et al., 2017; Ullah et al., 2016).
Another example is of Neelum Jehlum Hydropower Project that has gone around seven times of its initial depicted
cost because of an incompetent firm secured the bid by quoting lower rates (Ahmad et al., 2018; Razzaq et al., 2018;
Shabbar et al., 2017; Ullah et al., 2016). Further, New Islamabad International Airport has faced time overrun of a year
due to the inability of the winning firm to complete the project within its time constraints (Ahmad et al., 2018; Razzaq
et al., 2018; Shabbar et al., 2017; Ullah et al., 2016).

The bidding decision is a complex process that is affected by numerous external factors (Chou et al., 2013). Choosing
not to bid on a prospective project results in losing an opportunity to make a substantial profit, whereas entering into
bid may improve the strength of a contractor in the industry and gain positive relationships with the client (Jarkas et
al., 2014). Bidding for unsubstantial projects can result in huge losses that include the consumption of resources as
well as time that might have been invested in more profitable projects, ultimately resulting in financial failure of the
firm (Egemen & Mohamed, 2005). Surveys by previous scholars have identified some of the important factors in the
bid/no-bid decision making (Li et al., 2020; Shokri-Ghasabeh & Chileshe, 2016) but little consensus is found on optimal
or specific approach regarding the decision to bid. Enshassi et al. (2010) observed that the tendency to bid increases
with the size of firm, however, another found the opposite that propensity to bid and win a project decreases with the
growth in company size (Krasnokutskaya & Seim, 2011). Large construction firms in Saudi Arabia, for instance,
displayed greater tendency to bidding than small construction firms (Shash & Abdul-Hadi, 1993). The same conclusion
is derived for Northern Cyprus and Turkish contractors (Egemen & Mohamed, 2007). In addition, few researchers
(Bageis & Fortune, 2009) found that tendency to bid increases with the experience of construction firms, whereas
Krasnokutskaya and Seim (2011) found the converse. For instance, longer experienced contractors prefer large-sized
projects, while the less experienced contractors prefer small-sized projects (Enshassi et al., 2010; Nirab, 2007).
Nonetheless, wide-ranging thoughts are evident from literature with little consensus on specific factors influencing
the bid/no-bid decision for construction projects. It is difficult to fully understand bid/no-bid decision for construction
projects, for example, the existence of an association between extrinsic factors vis-a-vis CCF size and experience
(Bageis & Fortune, 2009; Chua & Li, 2000; Li et al., 2020). A firm generally arrives at a bid decision only after a complex
reasoning process that is influenced greatly by the firm size and its previous experience (Chua & Li, 2000; Ma, 2011).

The objective of this research is to evaluate the extrinsic factors including market, politics, client and region related
aspects that influence the CCF’s bid/no-bid decision for construction projects. Specifically, the current research
analyses differences in the bid decision of CCFs with respect to the firm size and experience. The findings of this study
provide novel insight to the bid/no-bid decision making literature with emphasis on clients and stakeholders’
obligations where these is scarcity of literature related to the association between influencing factors, firm size and
industrial experience. Further, the current study includes variables related to the politics that have been neglected in
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the previous studies (Bageis & Fortune, 2009) in addition to the previous factors, thus making the current study
unique in its examination for the bid/no-bid decision for construction projects.

According to the objective of the study, following research questions are proposed (see Figure 1):

RQ1. What are the market related factors that influence the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs of varied sizes and
experience?
RQ2. What are the politics related factors that influence the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs of varied sizes and
experience?
RQ3. What are the client related factors that influence the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs of varied sizes and experience?
RQ4. What are the region related factors that influence the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs of varied sizes and
experience?

There are two crucial decisions need to be made during the tendering process i.e. (1) decision to bid or not to bid, and
(2) decision based on bid price. Friedman (1956) was the first person who carried research on the bid price, decision to
bid and mark-up stage studies. Later, Gates (1967) used the same theme of research to produce his own work. From
1990s to the present day, various researches have been conducted on the bid decision making for construction
projects.

Nonetheless, there is large volume of literature available regarding the extrinsic and intrinsic factors affecting the
bid/no-bid decision for construction projects (Chua & Li, 2000; Egemen & Mohamed, 2007; Lowe & Parvar, 2004;
Shokri-Ghasabeh & Chileshe, 2016). The current study focuses on the extrinsic factors influencing the bid/no-bid
decision for construction projects with emphasis on firm size and experience. Extrinsic factors are defined as factors
related to the external environment i.e. competition in the market and region and factors related to the politics,
government and client history (Chua & Li, 2000; Jarkas et al., 2014). Nirab (2007) studied 94 characteristics relating to
the bidding decisions and classified them into three main categories, namely firm related factors, project related
factors and market related factors. Similarly, Wanous et al. (2003) developed a simple parametric model to explain the
bid/no-bid decision in the construction industry in Syria. Skitmore (2002) explained a number of factors that why
contractors prefer to go for or back out from a particular bidding procedure. These factors included number and
quality of bids successfully procured, strengths of the bidding process, levels of projected profit levels and the costs of
bidding process. Ahmad (1990) determined five important factors that affect the bid/no bid decisions in USA that are
need for work, historic benefits, type of job, owner’s reputation and degree of hazards. Similarly, Odusote & Fellows
(1992) identified 42 factors that affect the bid/no bid decision of contractors in UK. Out of these 42 factors, they
ranked the top five to be client’s ability to pay, type of work, profitability, client’s satisfaction and good relationship.
Shokri-Ghasabeh and Chileshe (2016) identified four factors to be the most critical during bid/no-bid decision; these
factors included client financial capability, project risk, project future benefits and profitability, and number of
competitors in the market.

Egemen & Mohamed (2007) assigned one of the main factors contributing in the bidding decisions as external market
involving the strategic related knowledge of the market. Sonmez & S6zgen (2017) stated the general principles upon
which the bidding behavior of a contractor depends upon, and they categorized the market condition as the primitive
factor in bidding process. Nirab (2007) while working on the study in the Gaza Strip identified the market related
factors as being pivotal in the bidding techniques. Bageis et al. (2019) concluded market value as one of the important
factors affecting the bidding decisions of CCFs in Saudi Arabia. Dulaimi and Shan (2002) found availability of other
projects as critical in the bid mark-up decisions of CCFs in Singapore. Enshassi et al. (2010) ranked number of
competitors in the market as one of the most important external factors influencing the bid/no-bid decisions of
contractors in the Palestinian construction industry.

Scholars identified in their studies that the CCFs work consist of general environment factors such as politics and laws
as well as competition factors such as finance, labor, suppliers, contractors and clients (Bageis et al., 2019; Newcombe
et al.,, 1990). Similarly, Akintoye & Skitmore (1990) stated that because of use of competitive bidding to award
contracts, a CCF’s survival strongly depends on its ability to work with different bidding situations. Various economic,
social and political situations dictate to the number of construction firms registered and the degree of competition for
construction works is vital. Other studies have shown that political trends, market potential, and technological
changes affects the determination of mark-up during the bidding decisions (Dulaimi & Shan, 2002). Mohanty (1992)
discovered that in some geographical locations such as India, the political angle and family pressure influences the

148



bidding decision. Enshassi et al. (2010) identified the stability of political conditions during construction among the top
three factors that affect the bidding decisions of the Palestinian construction contractors.

The client policies are determined by pursuits such as their advertisement characteristics, tendering systems and
reputation that influence the bid/ no-bid decision (Shokri-Ghasabeh & Chileshe, 2016). Enshassi et al. (2010) identified
that reputation and financial capability of the clients are critical factors influencing the bid/ no-bid decision of CCFs in
the Palestinian and Gaza Strip construction industry. Similarly, while referring to the basis of CCF bidding decisions,
Odusote & Fellows (1992), summed up their findings stating that the reputation and previous experience of the client
with the architect/engineer is a factor of prime importance in bidding decisions. Shash (1993) indicated client identity
as one of the most important factor influencing the bidding decisions of the CCF. Chua and Li (2000) concluded that
delay or shortage on payment habit of client can deeply influence the bidding decisions of CCFs. Bageis et al. (2019)
expanded their research upon the client characteristics in terms of the bidding choice and found out that the client’s
attitude played significant role in the CCF’s decision to bid. Client’s experience, transparency and reputation are
studied by various other researchers (Straub &Van Mossel, 2007) and are identified as factors of prime importance in
construction. Other researchers have found that the bid evaluation method of the client holds significant importance
in the bid/ no bid decision of CCFs (Magsoom et al., 2020; Wanous et al., 2003).

Regional stability and the condition of market greatly influence the bidding behaviors of the contractors (Enshassi et
al., 2010; Sonmez & Sozgen, 2017). CCF’s bidding decisions are staunchly emphasized upon the external conditions
and number of competitors in the region, their strengths and their stability. Odusote & Fellows (1992) reflected that in
a CCF, the contracts are undertaken depending upon the environmental competitiveness and regional coherence.
Hwang & Kim (2016) value the location of a project related to a particular region in terms of its stability and market
competitiveness as a primitive factor of the bidding process. Enshassi et al. (2010) proposed that the availability of raw
materials in the area and stability of the region are decisive factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision of contractors
in the Palestinian construction industry. Odusote & Fellows (1992) emphasized upon the location of the project as
significant in bidding decisions. The availability of skilled labor in the region is seen as an imperial factor in bidding
decisions of CCFs (Bageis et al., 2019). Dulaimi & Shan (2002) identified the availability of equipment and other
projects in the region as important factors in the Singaporean CCFs during their bidding decisions.

All of the above researches have valuably contributed to the bidding decision literature. Nonetheless, a
comprehensive model, which not only considers the project conditions but also includes the regional strategic
considerations, take into account the viewpoint of clients, differentiate among varied sizes and experiences of CCFs
and considers political factors present in developing countries will be of great value. In this regard, a comprehensive
conceptual framework is drawn based on above theoretical knowledge and is presented in Figure 1.

Figure 1. Conceptual Framework for Bid / No-Bid Decision of CCFs (Source: Self-Generated).

Market Political
A comparison between A comparison between politics
construction marketrelated factors related factors of large and small
of large and smallsize firms size firms
A comparison between A comparison between politics
construction market related factors related factors of matureandyoung
of mature and young experienced experienced firms
firms
Bid/No-Bid
Decision of CCFs
Client Region
A comparison between client A comparison between region
related factors of large and small related factors of large and small
size firms size firms
A comparison between client A comparison between region
related factors of mature and related factors of matureandyoung
young experienced firms experienced firms
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The current study is conducted in several stages with the first stage being the development and verification of a
questionnaire. In light of the literature review, deep insight is acquired into the construction of a questionnaire that
has the ability to capture imperative information to convert into meaningful results. The present study divided the
questionnaire into three sections; the first section acquired general demographic information of the participants. The
second section asked the information about the project and participant company. The third section is designed to
assess the effect of different extrinsic factors on the bid/no-bid decisions of CCFs. The factors are classified as market
related factors, politics related factors, client related factors and region related factors. The third section embraced
scales adapted from the previous validated studies conducted by scholars to measure extrinsic factors influencing the
bid/no-bid decision of firms (Bageis & Fortune, 2009; Egemen & Mohamed, 2007; Enshassi et al., 2010; Jarkas et al.,
2014; Shash & Abdul-Hadi, 1993). For the pilot testing, interviews are conducted with two general managers and five
project managers working in different firms. Necessary adjustments are made in the questionnaire based on the
suggestions provided by the respondents during the pilot study. Political factors have not been examined so far in the
previous researches related to bid/no-bid decision of firms; therefore, they were included in the questionnaire based
on the strong recommendation from the pilot test participants. The feedback from the pilot testing improved the
readability and quality of the questionnaire. Additionally, the purpose of pilot test was to examine the feasibility and
establish the validity of the research instrument.

Once the questionnaire is finalized, data collection took place using the survey approach. This research used the
purposive sampling method for the data collection. The target population was the CCFs working in Federal area of
Islamabad and Punjab province. The list of CCFs is obtained from Pakistan Engineering Council (PEC), a body that
register all the construction-contracting firms. The questionnaire is sent to 300 CCFs registered with PEC through post
or directly at their companies by the researchers. Respondent were asked to rate the factors from 1 to 5; with “1:
strongly disagree”, “2: disagree”, “3: neutral”, “4: agree”, “5: strongly agree”. Out of 300 questionnaires, 167
completed responses are returned representing a response rate of 56%. Therefore, the sample was 167 CCF who
participated in the research. No responses are collected from the remaining 133 firms due to their unwillingness to
respond. The characteristics of the responding organizations are illustrated in Table 1.

Table 1. Responding organizations characteristics (Source: Questionnaire survey).

Characteristics Frequency Percentage
Respondent’s designation
Chief Executive Officer / Managing Director 17 10
Director / Chairman / Head 45 27
General Manager / Project Manager 40 24
Assistant Project Manager 65 39
Firm’s specialization
Civil 80 48
Building 47 28
Electrical and mechanical 26 16
Other 14 08
Firm’s experience
<5 years 31 19
6-10 years 45 27
11-15 years 50 30
>15 years 41 24
Number of employees in the firm
<100 employees 45 27
101-500 employees 51 30
501-1000 employees 39 24
>1000 employees 32 19

After collecting the responses, the researchers divided the sample into large vs small firms and mature vs young firm’s
categories according to firm size and industrial experience. There are different classifications for firm size and
experience worldwide, which can vary by country, sector or region. For example, large firms are characterized as
having more than 250 or 300 employees; similarly, mature firms are seen as having experience more than 5 or 10
years (Abdul-Aziz et al., 2013; Magsoom & Charoenngam, 2014; Magsoom et al., 2019). In this research large firms are
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classified as having more than 250 employees and mature firms having experience 10 or more years in the
construction industry (Abdul-Aziz et al., 2013).

The data obtained from the respondents are analyzed using the Statistical Package for Social Sciences (SPSS) Version
25 for Windows. In the beginning, the Shapiro-Wilk test is utilized to examine the normality of the data. The results
showed that the data are not normally distributed, necessitating the use of a non-parametric test for the comparison
between the groups. Therefore, non-parametric Mann-Whitney U test is used to compare the scores given by firms of
varied sizes and industrial experiences. Various scholars (Abdul-Aziz et al., 2013; Dulaimi & Shan, 2002; Magsoom &
Charoenngam, 2014) have used the same approach to test the significant differences among the CCFs.

The results obtained from the survey show the presence of some significant differences between CCFs of varied sizes
and experiences for bid-no-bid decision. Only the factors that recorded statistically significant differences (p-
value<0.1) between small and large or young and mature firms are presented in this section.

Market Related Factors

The first phase of analysis is linked to the market related factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs. The Table
2 provides the results of market related factors that influence the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs with respect to size and
experience. In terms of firm size, two variables are considered more important by small firms than large firms: market
value (mean rank = 70.00 for large firms and mean rank = 87.85 for small firms, with p-value 0.043) and number of
competitors in the market (mean rank = 62.19 for large firms, and mean rank = 89.99 for small firms, with p-value
0.002). Similarly, in terms of experience, there is significant difference regarding market related factors in young and
mature firms. Two factors are considered more important by young firms than mature firms: availability of similar
type of project in the market (mean rank = 80.02 for mature firms and mean rank = 92.80 for young firms, with p-
value 0.099) and number of competitors in the market (mean rank= 78.16 for mature firms and mean rank= 96.91 for
young firms, with p-value 0.016).

Table 2. Market related factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision vis-a-vis CCF size and experience (Source: Analysis of the Survey).

Market related factors Mean rank for size Mean rank for experience
Large Small Significant Mature Young Significant
firms firms (2-tailed) firms firms (2-tailed)
Taxes and other financial 83.46 84.15 0.938 82.15 88.09 0.453
requirements on tender
Market value 70.00 87.85 0.043** 80.06 92.72 0.106
Quantity of overall projects in 74.47 86.62 0.170 85.55 80.58 0.528
the market (no of projects)
Availability of similar type of 75.54 86.60 0.167 80.02 92.80 0.099***
project in the market
Number of competitors in the 62.19 89.99 0.002* 78.16 96.91 0.016**
market

*P<0.01, **P<0.05 ***P<0.1

Politics Related Factors

The second phase of analysis is associated to the politics related factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs.
Table 3 shows the results of political factors that affect the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs with respect to size and
experience.

In terms of firm size, two variables are considered as more important by small firms than large firms including
relationship with government (mean rank = 67.26 for large firms, and mean rank = 88.60 for small firms, with p-value
0.016) and public acceptance to projects (mean rank= 67.85 for large firms, and mean rank= 86.62 for small firm, with
p-value 0.031). In terms of experience, contrariwise, there is little difference regarding politics related factors in young
and mature firms because there is only one factor, which is considered more important by mature firms than young
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firms i.e. government pressure during bidding (mean rank= 89.98 for mature firms and mean rank=70.78 for young
firms, with p-value of 0.014).

Table 3. Politics related factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision vis-a-vis CCF size and experience (Source: Survey Analysis).

Politics related factors Mean rank for size Mean rank for experience
Large Small Significant Mature Young Significant
firms firms (2-tailed) firms firms (2-tailed)
Politician reference for the gaining 76.36 86.10 0.269 79.80 93.30 0.383
of the project
Political conditions while 79.47 85.24 0.509 84.93 81.93 0.700
construction
Government pressure during 79.51 85.23 0.517 89.98 70.78 0.014*
bidding
Relationship with government 67.26 88.60 0.016* 86.80 77.82 0.256
Interference from the opposition 77.89 83.80 0.498 83.41 85.31 0.809
parties
Public acceptance to projects 67.85 86.62 0.031* 84.54 82.81 0.825
Change in government policies 79.74 83.28 0.685 82.63 87.03 0.576
*P<0.05

Client Related Factors
The third phase of analysis is connected to the client related factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs. Table
4 provides the results of client related factors that affect the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs with respect to size and

experience.

Table 4. Client related factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision vis-a-vis CCF size and experience (Source: Analysis of the Survey).

Client related factors Mean rank for size Mean rank for experience
Large Small Significant Mature Young Significant
firms firms (2-tailed) firms firms (2-tailed)
History of the client 87.88 82.94 0.576 91.88 66.58 0.001*
Current financial condition of the 72.53 87.15 0.095** 84.45 83.00 0.852
client
Client attitude 87.78 82.96 0.587 85.26 81.21 0.607
Politicians pressure on the client 89.60 82.46 0.421 88.15 74.82 0.090**
Method of bid evaluation of the 82.64 84.37 0.845 81.42 89.71 0.293
client
Business level of the client 93.63 81.35 0.166 88.45 74.16 0.070**
Project duration provided by the 72.29 87.22 0.090** 84.89 82.04 0.715
client

*P<0.01, **P<0.1

In terms of firm size, two variables are considered more important by small firms than large firms. They include
current financial condition of the client (mean rank = 87.15 for small firms, and mean rank = 72.53 for large firms, with
p-value 0.095), and project duration provided by the client (mean rank= 87.22 for small firms and mean rank= 72.29
for large firms, with p-value 0.090). In terms of experience, significant differences are observed between young and
mature firms regarding client related factors. In this context, three factors are considered more important by mature
firms than young firms. They are history of the client (mean rank = 91.88 for mature firms and mean rank = 66.58 for
young firms, with p-value 0.001), politician’s pressure on the client (mean rank = 88.15 for mature firms and mean
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rank = 74.82 for young firms, with p-value 0.090), and business level of the client (mean rank= 88.45 for mature firms
and mean rank= 74.16 for young firms, with p-value 0.070).

Region Related Factors
The fourth phase of analysis is connected to the region related factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs.

Table 5 indicates the results of region related factors that impact the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs with respect to size
and experience.

Table 5. Region related factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision vis-a-vis CCF size and experience (Source: Survey Analysis).

Mean rank for size Mean rank for experience

Large Small Significant Mature Young Significant
Region related factors firms firms (2-tailed) firms firms (2-tailed)
Availability of required material in  82.69 84.36 0.643 89.73 71.34 0.020*
the region
Availability of skilled labor 96.86 80.47 0.252 89.66 71.48 0.020*
Number of projects started in the 93.57 81.82 0.851 87.53 76.18 0.151
region
Stability of the political situation 89.33 82.53 0.062** 87.09 77.16 0.208
Availability of equipment in the 80.78 84.89 0.170 82.25 87.87 0.476
region
Availability of unskilled labor in the  91.94 81.37 0.444 86.13 79.28 0.383
region

*P<0.05 **P<0.1

In terms of size, only one variable is considered as more important by large firms than small firms in region related
factors i.e. stability of the political situation (mean rank= 89.33 for large firms, and mean rank= 82.53 for small firms,
with p-value 0.062).0n the other hand, in terms of experience there is significant difference observed between young
and mature firms because there are two factors, which are considered more important by mature firms than the
young firms. One factor is availability of required material in the region (mean rank = 89.73 for mature firms, and
mean rank = 71.34 for young firms, with p-value 0.020) and the other factor is availability of skilled labor (mean rank=
89.66 for mature firms, and mean rank= 71.48 for young firms, with p-value 0.020).

Results of the current study are presented in the previous section shown in Table 2 to Table 5. Discussion is provided
in this section especially on the significant factors. The findings are compared with previous studies for their
implication in the construction industry.

During the first phase, three significant factors related to market are determined that influence the bid/no-bid
decision of CCFs of varied sizes and experience. A change in the construction market, even one of infinitesimal value
can have major effects on the smaller CCFs since these firms are producing a small quantity of business due to their
limited human capital and other resources. In the situation of an increased ‘market value’, the chance of the wining a
bid for a small firm is decreased due to entrance of numerous competitors and clients having a greater variety of
choices. On the other hand, if the ‘market value’ is decreasing then large firms have more advantages than that of the
small firms as small firms are unable to compete with larger firms due to limited experience and recognition of
reputation in the market specifically if the ‘market value’ is negative (Staniewski et al., 2016).

Young firms consider ‘availability of similar type of project in the market’” more important as compared to large firms.
Young firms believe that if there are more similar types of projects in the market, they have a greater chance to win
the project because they have more experience with that specific type of project and at the same time these similar
projects increases their annual revenue and their experience (Krasnokutskaya & Seim, 2011; Shokri-Ghasabeh &
Chileshe, 2016).

‘Number of the competitors in the market’ is considered more important factor by small firms as compared to the

large firms. Small firms have less equipment and managerial staff to overcome the weak points of their firm so they
believe that if the ‘numbers of competitors in the market’ are more then there is a decreased chance of winning a
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tender (Bustos-Salvagno, 2015; Oyeyipo et al., 2016). This factor is also more important for the young firms as
compared to the mature firms as young firms believe if numerous competitors are participating in the industry, clients
have a greater pool of firms to choose from, which gives firms with a greater reputation an upper hand and minimizes
their chances of winning a project.

During the second phase, three significant factors related to politics are determined that influence the bid/no-bid
decision of CCFs of varied sizes and experience. Mature firms have lots of experience and they had built a significant
reputation in the industry. Every mature firm competes for mega projects to acquire a large profit and for developing
a long-term relationship with the government but numerous mature firms experience “government pressure during
bidding’ because a mega project is awarded to the firm with a strong relationship with the present government
(Bageis et al., 2019; Bageis & Fortune, 2009). Nonetheless, numerous mature firms are discouraged from bidding due
to fear of rejection.

Small firms consider the ‘relationship with the government’ more important factor as compared to large firms. They
attempt to develop long-term relationships with every government in power. Small firms have less finance, experience
and reputation as compared to large firms. Due to this disparity in resources smaller firms believe that if they have a
good relationship with the government, their cost overrun and time overrun in public projects are tolerated by the
authorities to some extent (Heravi & Mohammadian, 2020; Jarkas et al., 2014). This factor is imperative for larger
firms but comparable less to smaller firms. Larger firms have robust relationships with a number of politicians in
addition to a strong reputation in the market and they are not discouraged from competing in the market due to
governmental factors.

‘Public acceptance of projects’ is considered more important factor by small firms as compared to the large firms.
Small firms are well aware of the fact that to compete in the construction industry, they have to acquire projects that
have public support in order to increase their chances of acquiring more projects in the future. On the other hand,
public outcry and opposition to a large project acquired by a smaller firm face greater issue of acceptance to the
project especially if there are aspects of shady business dealings. Due to their smaller capacity, small firms do not have
the budget to build stakeholder relationships with the public or develop public relationship programs. This inability
stretches to government levels and smaller firms refrain from participating in bids of mega projects that face the
opposition of the public (Enshassi et al., 2010; Nirab, 2007).

During the third phase, five significant factors related to clients are determined that influence the bid/no-bid decision
of CCFs of varied sizes and experience. Clients, whether they are from the public or private sectors need to make cash
payments to CCFs on time. ‘History of the client (payment in the past project)’ is an imperative factor for mature
firms. Mature firms usually take larger projects to make more profit and develop a portfolio that is extensive for
marketing purposes. Larger projects are costly and more cash is needed in circulation for efficient output, and prompt
payment habit of the client is more crucial for mature firms than it is for young firms. If client is not habitual of paying
on time, there is a greater risk for project delay or failure (Egemen & Mohamed, 2007; Shokri-Ghasabeh & Chileshe,
2016).

‘Current financial condition of the client’ is considered more important factor by the small firms as compared to large
firms because small firms cannot take huge risks and are afraid that the client would not clear their bills on time so
they would be unable to start a new project due to the limited finance. The result is similar to the findings of El-
Mashaleh (2013) who concluded that “client financial capabilities” are the highest ranked variables. Large firms have
more capital than that of small firms and the profit made by large firms is more than that of small one (Shokri-
Ghasabeh & Chileshe, 2016). Small firms want that client should have more liquidity.

According to the current findings, ‘politician’s pressure on a client’ is more important factor for mature firms as
compared to young firms. Politics is an influential factor that is critical in order to secure projects. The construction
sector is significantly influenced by politics and greatly susceptible to political pressures (Razzaq et al., 2018). Mature
companies usually bid on larger projects to make more profit, and politician’s pressure on the client can be a cause of
various unexpected losses. It is important for mature firms to consider this factor whereas young firms normally bid
for smaller projects, which eliminates the need for excessive political maneuvering and favors.

“Business level of the client” is considered more important factor by mature firms than young firms. Business level is
classified as small, medium and large business level based on profit or revenue generated through projects. As the
mature firms want to make more profits by gaining larger projects, they definitely prefer higher business level than
medium or small business level. In contrast, young firms need projects despite of looking at business level of the client
to gain fame in construction market and profit (Krasnokutskaya & Seim, 2011).

‘Project duration provided by the client’ is very important to consider while bidding. According to the results, project
duration given by the client is more important factor for small firms compared to large firms. Small firms do not have
much experienced staff, equipment and managerial staff; also, they are not well familiar about the different site
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conditions, weather conditions, geological conditions, and uncertain risks as compared to the large firms. To
overcome these uncertainties, enough time given to complete the project is much more important for small firms
than large firms (Bageis & Fortune, 2009).

During the fourth phase, three significant factors related to region are determined that influence the bid/no-bid
decision of CCFs of varied sizes and experience. ‘The availability of required materials in the region’ is considered more
important by mature firms than that of young firms. This is because these firms are experienced and well aware of the
time and money spent on carrying materials from one place to another. Mature firms want to have as much profit as
possible out of every project so it is important for them that the required material need to be procured near the
construction site (Krasnokutskaya & Seim, 2011).

‘Availability of skilled labor’ is marked more important by the mature firms as compared to young firms. This is
because transporting skilled labor from headquarters to the site is difficult and expensive as there are costs for food,
accommodation and transportation. Hence, mature firms attempt to hire skilled labor from places close to the
construction site so that they can minimize expenses (Bageis et al., 2019; Krasnokutskaya & Seim, 2011).

Large firms rated ‘stability of the political situation in the region’ is more important than that of small firms. They are
well aware of the fact that if the political situations in the region of project are not favorable then taking the whole
crew there and work would be highly risky, which can lead to severe losses in terms of both man-power and resources
they are going to use on site (Magsoom et al., 2019). As large firms move with more crew and equipment as
compared to smaller firms, they face the chance of a higher degree of loss and hence, give this factor more
importance than that of small firms.

To summarize, significant differences have been observed in the extrinsic factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision
of CCFs vis-a-vis their size and experience. Market related factors that influence the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs of
varied sizes and experience include ‘market value’, ‘availability of similar type of projects in the market’, and ‘number
of competitors in the market’. Politics related factors that influence the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs of varied sizes and
experience include ‘government pressure during bidding’, ‘relationship with government’, and ‘public acceptance of
projects’. Client related factors that influence the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs of varied sizes and experience include
‘history of the client (payment in the past project)’, ‘current financial condition of the client’, ‘politicians pressure on
the client’, ‘business level of the client’ and ‘project duration provided by the client’. Region related factors that
influence the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs of varied sizes and experience include ‘availability of required material in the
region’, ‘availability of skilled labor’ and ‘stability of the political situation in the region’. The significant differences in
these 14 extrinsic factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs are shown in Table 6.

Table 6. Significant extrinsic factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision vis-a-vis CCF size and experience (Source: Results from Table 2 to Table 5).

CCF size CCF experience
Large Small Mature Young
Extrinsic factors firms firms firms firms
Market related factors
Market value x v - -
Availability of similar type of projects in the market - - x v
Number of competitors in the market x v x v
Politics related factors
Government pressure during bidding - - v x
Relationship with government x v - -
Public acceptance of projects x v - -
Client related factors
History of the client (payment in the past project) - - v x
Current financial condition of the client x v - -
Politicians pressure on the client - - v
Business level of the client - - v
Project duration provided by the client x v - -
Region related factors
Availability of required material in the region - - v
Availability of skilled labor - -
Stability of the political situation in the region v x - -
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The objective of this research is to explore the differences in extrinsic factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision of
construction contracting firms (CCFs) having varied sizes and industrial experiences. The results of the study shed light
on the various degrees of differences between small and large, and young and mature CCFs with regard to factors
influencing the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs. In terms of firm size, the results revealed that small CCFs are more
affected by the market related factors such as market value and number of competitors in the market and client
related factors such as current financial condition of the client and project duration given by the client as compared to
their larger counterparts. The importance relayed to these factors is reflective of the construction firms own standing
in the market which is developed by its reputation, political ties, financial health, human capital, and adequate
resources for competition. A significant finding in the current study leads to the conclusion that small CCFs are
discouraged from bidding on large-scale projects, as they have limited political resources to acquire the projects.

In terms of firm experience, the results found that mature CCFs are more affected by the client related and regional
connected factors as compared to the young firms. They are pressured by the government in various forms
concerning to bidding. Additionally, mature CCFs are more concerned about the history and financial soundness of
client as well as availability of required material and skilled labor in the market. Conversely, young CCFs are more
influenced by the market related factors such as availability of similar type of projects in the market and number of
competitors in the market. It is evident from the current case that in order for the construction industry to thrive and
compete, there needs to be extensive reforms in the government specifically when it comes to interacting with small
CCFs.

This study contributes to the previous literature by adding to the limited research work on the bid/no-bid decision of
CCFs. This work provides novel insights on bid/no-bid decision making of CCFs by showing how firm size and
experience is associated with their bidding decisions. Additionally, the findings of this study will help CCFs to capitalize
on the key extrinsic factors influencing their bidding decision as per their respective size and experience. Lastly, the
results of this study can be useful for the CCFs belonging to other regions and countries having the construction
industry structure same as that of the developing country.

Study limitations and future research directions

The current research findings are to be viewed taking into account that the work is exploratory and focuses only on
the construction sector of a developing country, particularly Federal and Punjab province area. Nonetheless, the
findings of the current research can be applied to other developing regions and countries with caution. In future, the
scholars may take into consideration a bigger sample size from other provinces as well as other developing countries
in order to generalize the results across larger population. Internal factors related to the management and
organization are not studied in this work. Researchers may investigate the impact of firm size and experience on
internal factors influencing the bid/no-bid decision of CCFs. In addition, if a study is conducted using a longitudinal
method, it may yield valuable results.
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